
BEYOND
THE WA

While here, students are often
fascinated by the outside world
and its happenings.

It has been quite a year!
While an American rock star

entertained thousands in Russia,
our President and the Soviet Pre-
mier teased the world with
thoughts of nuclear peace.

Nobody really exciting wanted
to be President in 1989.

Boyfriends were very reluctant
to take their girlfriends to see the
film, "Fatal Attraction."

Wall Street crashed again.
The Twins won, the Devils im-

proved, but the Giants struggled.
The football players went on

strike again.
Calgary? Seoul?? Well, why

not?
Friendly? Honest? Centrist in

viewpoint? Pure of heart? Apply:
US Supreme Court, Washington,
DC.

And a bull terrier became the
best-known national spokesper-
son for beer.

Whether it was the world series,
the Presidential elections, or the
Winter Olympics, students paid
very close attention.

Maybe, just maybe, some
wished that they were in Calgary
instead of period 10 English . . .


